
... 

: E-<j AGRICU~~""' !6',: : -(; ,, i~: 
~ ;l$j: 
~4~~ .. 
;.--;·'?,,.~-· 
l1 -•· 

•••••• 

~tate of \lCennessee 

PUBLIC CHAPTER NO. 576 

HOUSE BILL NO. 1788 

By Representative Capley 

Substituted for: Senate Bill No. 1743 

By Senator Swann 

AN ACT to amend Tennessee Code Annotated, Title 12, Chapter 3, Part 6, relative to 
records retention for state contracts. 

BE IT ENACTED BY THE GENERAL ASSEMBLY OF THE STATE OF TENNESSEE: 

SECTION 1. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 12-3-602(b), is amended by deleting 
"three (3) years" and substituting "five (5) years". 

SECTION 2. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 12-3-602(c), is amended by deleting 
"three (3) years" wherever it appears in the subsection and substituting "five (5) years". 

SECTION 3. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 12-3-602(c), is amended by deleting 
"July 1, 2013," and substituting "July 1, 2024,". 

SECTION 4. This act takes effect on July 1, 2024, the public welfare requiring it, and 
applies to agreements for the procurement of goods and services for the use of state 
government entered into, amended, or renewed on or after that date. 



HOUSE BILL NO. 1788 

PASSED: March 4. 2024 

CAME~EXTON,SPEAKER 
HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

RANDY MCNAIL Y 
SPEAKER OF THE SENATE 

APPROVED this IS -r,,,... day of rv\CArc.b 2024 

lu -BILL LEE, GOVERNOR 


	pc0576



